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A New and Different Atmosphere 

 
Understand the mind of the Lord. Understand My visitations, all who have 

ears to hear and eyes to see, that when I come and shut you down and quiet you, it 
is a supernatural visitation of My Spirit to begin to recalibrate—I can put it in my 
own words: He wants to reboot you. For many, many voices are in the world, and 
the noise that is in your head that talks, mostly is the noise that occupies your 
world and demands your attention. But hear these words: Hear the voice of the 
Bridegroom that cometh: Behold, I come quickly, and My reward is with Me, says 
the Spirit of Grace.  

I desire to shut you down so that I can come in and rearrange your priorities, 
says the Spirit of Grace. This is what He said. For sooner than what you realize, the 
services that you call “church” will take upon themself a new and a different 
atmosphere. For presently you come together to worship Me and bind yourselves 
together in that place of adoration, and these things are My foundation which will 
always remain, but know this, that there is unto you given a great opportunity for 
the harvest, says the Spirit of Grace. And soon the emphasis in your hearts, as has 
always been in Mine, will be whom you bring in and whom you go out and 
minister to in the highways and the byways, says the Spirit of Grace.  

For I desire that the latter Church exceed the former Church, says the Spirit 
of Grace, so that that which is on you in these last days is a shining witness of 
everything that I left in the earth, says the Spirit of the Lord. So that when you 
come together, your joy will be in this: watching the masses come together with 
you and surrender their life unto the One who gave His life for their salvation, says 
the Spirit of the Lord.  

I will visit you. Do not think it strange that I will visit you in these times and 
seasons and bring everything to a quietness. Don’t try, don’t strive, do not debate 
inside yourself—surrender. Surrender what you hear. Surrender what I say. 
Surrender and know this, that if I ask of you that I also give you the grace and the 
strength and the empowerment to yield your members over to Me, says the Spirit.  
 
 
 
 


